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Proper Citation

Traumatic Brain Injury Clinical Trials Network (RRID:SCR_013165)

Resource Information

URL: http://www.nichd.nih.gov/research/supported/pages/tbi.aspx

Proper Citation: Traumatic Brain Injury Clinical Trials Network (RRID:SCR_013165)

Description: The National Center for Medical Rehabilitation Research (NCMRR) established 
a multi-center network of sites that are working together to design clinical intervention 
protocols and measures of outcome for TBI. Through rigorous patient evaluation, using 
common protocols and interventions designed for multiple points of care??????including the 
accident scene, emergency room, intensive care unit, rehabilitation and long-term follow-
up??????the NCMRR TBI Clinical Trials Network can study the required numbers of patients 
to provide answers more rapidly than individual centers acting alone. This interdisciplinary 
research Network is designed to evaluate the relationship among acute care practice, 
rehabilitation strategies, and the long-term functional outcome of TBI patients??????that is, 
to identify which intervention variables result in improvements in long-term outcomes. Taking 
advantage of the network model structure has allowed TBI research to progress toward a 
number of clinical research goals. Specifically, the NCMRR wants to highlight two major 
achievements to date. First, the TBI Network created a profile of its typical patient to 
determine the number of patients with different clinical features who might be eligible for 
future studies and to help estimate recruitment times necessary. Second, Network 
researchers are developing clinical treatment guidelines and procedures for all points in the 
continuum of care, including TBI Clinical Trials Network Guidelines for surgical care, systems-
based protocol for severe and moderate TBI patients, deep-vein thrombosis prophylaxis 
procedures, and rehabilitation guidelines for physical therapy, speech-language pathology, 
occupational therapy, and neuropsychology.

Abbreviations: TBI Clinical Trials Network
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Synonyms: NCMRR TBI Clinical Trials Network, Traumatic Brain Injury (TBI) Clinical Trials 
Network

Resource Type: portal, disease-related portal, data or information resource, topical portal, 
knowledge environment, research forum portal

Keywords: traumatic brain injury, clinical, research, clinical trial, outcome, intervention, one 
mind tbi

Related Condition: Traumatic Brain Injury

Funding: NCMRR

Resource Name: Traumatic Brain Injury Clinical Trials Network

Resource ID: SCR_013165

Alternate IDs: nlx_143904

Alternate URLs: http://www.nichd.nih.gov/research/supported/TBI.cfm

Record Creation Time: 20220129T080314+0000

Record Last Update: 20250429T055601+0000

Ratings and Alerts

No rating or validation information has been found for Traumatic Brain Injury Clinical Trials 
Network.

No alerts have been found for Traumatic Brain Injury Clinical Trials Network.

Data and Source Information

Source:  SciCrunch Registry 

Usage and Citation Metrics

We have not found any literature mentions for this resource.
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