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Proper Citation

UCSF Helen Diller Family Comprehensive Cancer Center (RRID:SCR_008857)

Resource Information

URL: http://cancer.ucsf.edu/

Proper Citation: UCSF Helen Diller Family Comprehensive Cancer Center 
(RRID:SCR_008857)

Description: The UCSF Helen Diller Family Comprehensive Cancer Center combines basic 
science, clinical research, epidemiology/cancer control, and patient care throughout the 
University of California, San Francisco. UCSF''s long tradition of excellence in cancer 
research includes, notably, the Nobel Prize-winning work of J. Michael Bishop and Harold 
Varmus, who discovered cancer-causing oncogenes. Their work opened new doors for 
exploring genetic mistakes that cause cancer, and formed the basis for some of the most 
important cancer research happening today. * Basic Scientific Research: From 
understanding normal cellular processes and replication to discovering the underlying 
molecular and genetic causes of cancer when these processes go awry, UCSF researchers 
are committed to moving scientific insights beyond model systems and pursuing their 
relevance for clinical oncology and cancer prevention. * Clinical Research: Clinical scientists 
explore how greater understanding of fundamental biological events can be transformed into 
clinically relevant tools. New forms of cancer treatment, as well as innovations in diagnosis 
and prognosis, undergo rigorous evaluation for safety and efficacytranslating into improved 
patient outcomes and hope for the future. * Patient Care: The Helen Diller Family 
Comprehensive Cancer Center provides superlative cancer patient care at four San 
Francisco medical centers: UCSF Medical Center at Mount Zion; UCSF Medical Center at 
Parnassus; San Francisco General Hospital; and the San Francisco Veterans Affairs Medical 
Center. * Population Science: Cancer population sciences at UCSF includes a broad range 
of research on the causes of new cancers and the sickness and death due to the disease in 
order to develop ways to improve the prevention and early detection of cancer as well as the 
quality of life following diagnosis and treatment for all of Northern California''s diverse 
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populations.

Abbreviations: UCSF Helen Diller Family Comprehensive Cancer Center

Resource Type: topical portal, portal, data or information resource

Related Condition: Cancer

Funding:

Resource Name: UCSF Helen Diller Family Comprehensive Cancer Center

Resource ID: SCR_008857

Alternate IDs: nlx_149151

Record Creation Time: 20220129T080249+0000

Record Last Update: 20250503T060039+0000

Ratings and Alerts

No rating or validation information has been found for UCSF Helen Diller Family 
Comprehensive Cancer Center.

No alerts have been found for UCSF Helen Diller Family Comprehensive Cancer Center.

Data and Source Information

Source:  SciCrunch Registry 

Usage and Citation Metrics

We found 1 mentions in open access literature.

Listed below are recent publications. The full list is available at NIF.

de Jesus Cortez F, et al. (2016) Disulfide-Trapping Identifies a New, Effective Chemical 
Probe for Activating the Nuclear Receptor Human LRH-1 (NR5A2). PloS one, 11(7), 
e0159316.
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