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Proper Citation

Clinical and Translational Science Awards Consortium (RRID:SCR_008339)

Resource Information

URL: https://www.ctsacentral.org/

Proper Citation: Clinical and Translational Science Awards Consortium 
(RRID:SCR_008339)

Description: National consortium of medical research institutions working together to 
transform the local, regional, and national environment to increase the efficiency and speed 
of clinical and translational research across the country. Consortium members share a 
common vision to reduce the time it takes for laboratory discoveries to become treatments 
for patients, to engage communities in clinical research efforts and to train clinical and 
translational researchers. This consortium includes 60 medical research institutions located 
throughout the nation, linking them together to energize the discipline of clinical and 
translational science. The CTSA consortium has five Strategic Goals: * National Clinical and 
Translational Research Capability * The Training and Career Development of Clinical and 
Translational Scientists * Consortium-Wide Collaborations * The Health of our Communities 
and the Nation * T1 Translational Research

Abbreviations: CTSA

Synonyms: Clinical & Translational Science Awards, Clinical and Translational Science 
Awards

Resource Type: knowledge environment

Keywords: biomedical, clinical, community, consortium, institution, laboratory, medical, 
patient, research, researcher, science, translational, translational research, treatment

Funding: National Center for Advancing Translational Sciences 2U54TR000123

https://neuinfo.org
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Resource ID: SCR_008339

Alternate IDs: nif-0000-24968
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Ratings and Alerts

No rating or validation information has been found for Clinical and Translational Science 
Awards Consortium.

No alerts have been found for Clinical and Translational Science Awards Consortium.

Data and Source Information

Source:  SciCrunch Registry 

Usage and Citation Metrics

We found 6 mentions in open access literature.

Listed below are recent publications. The full list is available at NIF.

Su Y, et al. (2016) Quantitative Amyloid Imaging in Autosomal Dominant Alzheimer's 
Disease: Results from the DIAN Study Group. PloS one, 11(3), e0152082.

Su Y, et al. (2015) Quantitative amyloid imaging using image-derived arterial input function. 
PloS one, 10(4), e0122920.

Moore SE, et al. (2015) Statistical Machines for Trauma Hospital Outcomes Research: 
Application to the PRospective, Observational, Multi-Center Major Trauma Transfusion 
(PROMMTT) Study. PloS one, 10(8), e0136438.

Batman AM, et al. (2015) Translating Alcohol Research: Opportunities and Challenges. 
Alcohol research : current reviews, 37(1), 7.

Klein MM, et al. (2015) Transcranial magnetic stimulation of the brain: guidelines for pain 
treatment research. Pain, 156(9), 1601.
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