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Proper Citation

Concierge (RRID:SCR_002386)

Resource Information

URL: http://concierge.sourceforge.jp/

Proper Citation: Concierge (RRID:SCR_002386)

Description: A data management tool which stores, classifies and manages digital 
resources such as publications, experimental data, presentation files, etc, together with its 
metadata. A key feature of the software is a high level of extensibility. By installing optional 
plug-ins, users can customize and extend the usability of the software based on their needs. 
It has a function of sharing data with open digital archives based on the XooNIps system, 
such as neuroinformatics platforms in operation and publicly available at J-Node 
(http://www.neuroinf.jp). The Concierge Project is a part of neuroinformatics research by 
Laboratory for Neuroinformatics in RIKEN Brain Science Institute. Concierge's primary goal 
is to encourage research resource sharing in neuroscience communities. A key feature of the 
software is its pluggable configuration. Based on the basic functions, various applications 
can be developed as plug-ins. It has already developed several application plug-ins specific 
to neuroscience research, e.g. literature manager, electronic laboratory notebook, etc.

Abbreviations: Concierge

Synonyms: Concierge: Personal Database Software for Managing Digital Research 
Resources, Concierge Project, Concierge: Personal Database Software for Digital Research 
Resources, The Concierge Project: Personal Database Software for Digital Research 
Resources

Resource Type: software resource, data management software, software application

Defining Citation: PMID:18974800

Keywords: literature manager, labnote, electronic laboratory notebook, plug-in, resource 

https://neuinfo.org
https://neuinfo.org/data/record/nlx_144509-1/SCR_002386/resolver
http://concierge.sourceforge.jp/
https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/18974800


management, resource sharing

Funding:

Availability: Open unspecified license; Mac OS X and Windows XP versions

Resource Name: Concierge

Resource ID: SCR_002386

Alternate IDs: nif-0000-00379

Record Creation Time: 20220129T080213+0000

Record Last Update: 20250503T055508+0000

Ratings and Alerts

No rating or validation information has been found for Concierge.

No alerts have been found for Concierge.

Data and Source Information

Source:  SciCrunch Registry 

Usage and Citation Metrics

We found 10 mentions in open access literature.

Listed below are recent publications. The full list is available at NIF.

Macalupu V, et al. (2025) Human-robot interactions and experiences of staff and service 
robots in aged care. Scientific reports, 15(1), 2495.

Yu Y, et al. (2025) Distributed, immutable, and transparent biomedical limited data set 
request management on multi-capacity network. Journal of the American Medical Informatics 
Association : JAMIA, 32(2), 296.

Woodard KT, et al. (2024) A population health approach to workplace mental health: 
rationale, implementation and engagement. Frontiers in public health, 12, 1336898.
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housing communities during the COVID-19 pandemic. BMC health services research, 24(1), 
250.
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disorder among adolescents in Japan: A preliminary survey in Sapporo. PCN reports : 
psychiatry and clinical neurosciences, 1(1), e4.

Rai V, et al. (2022) Transcriptomic Analysis Identifies Differentially Expressed Genes 
Associated with Vascular Cuffing and Chronic Inflammation Mediating Early Thrombosis in 
Arteriovenous Fistula. Biomedicines, 10(2).

Minvielle E, et al. (2021) Current developments in delivering customized care: a scoping 
review. BMC health services research, 21(1), 575.

Mandel AL, et al. (2020) The Impact of a Concierge Medicine Model on Door to Doctor Time 
and Patient Flow in an Urban Emergency Department. Open access emergency medicine : 
OAEM, 12, 13.

Tan C, et al. (2020) Improving Well-Being Among Trainees: A Partnership to Reduce 
Barriers to Primary Care Services. Journal of graduate medical education, 12(2), 203.

Sakai H, et al. (2007) Concierge: personal database software for managing digital research 
resources. Frontiers in neuroinformatics, 1, 5.


